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FAST FACTS 

 

 Fast Figures    

  Belize Global  

 Revenues US$ - 4.7 billion  

 Personnel 34 40,197  

 Offices 2 725  

 *As at 30 September 2014 
 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

How we work 

We always aim to bring together our industry expertise and 
multi-functional skills to better serve our clients, by providing 
industry-tailored solutions to each organisation. 

Why Grant Thornton 

Grant Thornton is one of the world’s leading organisations of 
independent assurance, tax and advisory firms. These firms 
help dynamic organisations unlock their potential for growth 
by providing meaningful, actionable advice. Proactive teams, 
led by approachable partners in these firms, use insights, 
experience and instinct to understand complex issues for 
privately owned, publicly listed and public sector clients and 
help them to find solutions. More than 40,000 Grant 
Thornton people, across over 130 countries, are focused on 
making a difference to clients, colleagues and the 
communities in which we live and work. 

Our clients 
We provide services to multi-national and large national 
enterprises; public institutions; and a cadre of fast-growing 
small businesses.   

What we do 

We provide a wide range of services to our clients:  

 Assurance 

 Advisory 

 

Other services 

 Corporate Services 

 Outsourcing 

 

 

Claude C. Burrell 

Managing partner 

“We help our clients to realise their ambitions and unlock 

their potential for growth.”     

Claude C. Burrell 

 

Who we are  

Grant Thornton, LLP has a compliment of two partners, two 
directors and 30 professionals delivering distinctive and 
personalised professional services to local and international 
clients. The firm has distinguished itself as one of the leading 
firms in Belize by providing timely and quality services over 
its 30 years of existence. We are number one in terms of size 
and we pride ourselves for being the firm with the most 
professional designations in Belize.  
 

Where we are  

We have two office one in Belize City and another in Corazal 
Free Zone, on the border with Mexico. 

 

Contact us 

Grant Thornton Belize, LLP 

T + 501 227 3020 

E info@gt.bz.com  

W www.grantthornton.bz  
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